
SPECIAL ISSUE

Kenya Gazette Supplement No.9l

( lzgislative Supplement No. 45 )

LEoAL NoTICE No. I38

THE TAX PROCEDURES ACT, 2OI5

(No.29 of2015)

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section ll2of the Tax
Procedures Act,2015, the Cabinet Secretary for the National Treasury
and Planning makes the following Regulations-

THE TAX PROCEDURES (TAX AGENTS) REGULATIONS,2OIE

l These Regulations may be cited as the Tax Procedures (Tax
Agents) Regulations, 201 8.

2. In these Regulations, unless the context otherwise requires-

"Committee" means the Tax Agent Committee established under
regulation 7;

"misconduct" includes making false tax declarations, aiding alld
abetting tax evasion and any conduct prohibited by any law rclating to
the collection of tax:

"practicing cenificate" means a certificate issued to a person by a

recognized professional association which permits that person to
practice that profession:

"regisuation cenificatc" means the ccrtificatc issued by the
Commissioner undcr rcgulation 3; and

"tax agent" means a person registered by the Commissioner as a

tax agent under regulation 3.

3. (l) A person who wishes to act as a tax agent shall apply in
wriring to the Commissioner for registration.

(2) An application made under subrcgulation (l) shall b€
accompanied by a non-refundable fee of twenty thousand shillings.

(3) The Commissioner may register a person as a tax agent iI
that person is tax compliant and-

(a) is a member of the Institutc of Ccnified Public Accountants
of Kcnya;

(b) is an advocate of the High Coun of Kenya and holds a

current pmcticing cenificate;

(c) is a former tax administrator with at lcast ten years'
expericnce in tax administmtion; or

(d) is a holder of any other rclevant qualifications and
experience recognized by the Commissioner as sufficient for
a tax agent.

29th June

2049

2018

-\\^9

VJI

1^r:

a
l"1

(^

et\^

Ciration

Inl! ptrtadoo.

\

\/r la' I 
t

1\\\

Rcgistration of tax
a8cnt.



2050 Ke nya Subsrdrury lt gts lqt Dn, 20 1 8

(4) Whcrc thc Commrssroncr rs satrsficd that a pcrson ts

qualrlicd for rcgrstratron as e tax agcnt, thc Commrsstoncr shall tssuc a

ccnrficate of rcgrstratron rn thc prcscnb€d form

(5) Thcse Rcgulatrons shall not apply to a non-rcstdcnt who ts

tcmporanly rn Kcnya for thc solc purposc of rcprcscnttng a cltcnt on lax
maltcrs

4. Thc functlons of a tax agcnt shall be to-
(a) prcparc and submlt lax rctums on tchalf of a taxpaycr,

(b) Larsc wrth the Kcnya Rcvcnuc Authoflty on bchalf of a

taxpaycr on matters rclatrng to tax,

(c) advrsc and rcprcsenl a taxpaycr rn mattcrs rclatrng to tax
bcforc the Commrssroncr or thc Tnbunal cstabhshcd undcr
thc Tax Appcals Tnbunal Act,20l3; and

(d) deal wrfi any othcr mattcrs that rclatc to tax on bchalf of a

taxpayer

5 ( I ) Thc Commlssroncr shall marntaln a regrster of tax agcnts
whlch shall contarn-

(a) the namcs of all tax agcnts;

(b) thc quahficatrons of thc tax agcnts,

(c) thc addrcss of thc pnncrpal places of buslncss of the tax
agents and any othcr placc whcrc the tax agcnts may opcratc
from, and

(d) such othcr rnformatron as thc Commrssloncr may constdcr
ncccssary

(2) A tax agcnt shall notrfy thc Commrssroncr of any changc rn

thc rnformatron rn thc rcgrstcr wrthrn founccn days of such changc

6 (l) A tax agcnt shall act in a profcsslonal manner tn provrdtng
scrvrcc to hls or hcr chcnls ro cnablc thcm to comply wlth thc
rcqurrcmcnts of any tax law

2. Wrthout prcjudrcc to thc forcgorng, a tax agcnt shall-

(a) comply wrth any norrcc scrvcd on thc tax agcnt by thc
Commrssroncr wrthrn thc penod spccrficd rn thc notrcc,

(b) marntarn a rcglst€r contarnrng thc followlng detalls-

(r) lhc namcs ofall thc cLcnts,

(I) the datc ofengagcmcnt by cach clrcnt,

(rrr) thc physrcal addrcsscs, postal addrcsscs and any othcr
contacl dctarls of cach clcnt, and

(!v) rnformatron rclatrng to thc naturc of thc buslncss that
cach clrcnt rs cngagcd rn, and

(c) marntarn propcr records lndrcatrng-

alcnK

Act No 40 of
2013

Rcglstcr for tzx
.8cnls

Conducr of lex
aScnt



Kenyu Subsidian Izgislation, 2018 2051

(i) the date whcn the last income tax retum or specified
notice was submitted to the Commissioneri

(ii) the tax payablc or paid; and

(iii) such other paniculars as the Commissioner may from
time to time direct.

7. (l) The Cabinet Secrctary shall, for the purpose of these

Regulations, appoint by notice in lhe Gazette. a Tax Agent Committee
which shall consider applications for registration of tax agents and

investigate any allegations of misconduct made against tax agents.

(2) The Committee shall comprise of-
(a) a chairperson who shall be from the private sector wilh at

least ten years' relevant experience and holds a degree in
taxation, finance, accountinS, economics or law from a

university recognized in Kcnya:

(b) a representative of the Institute of Cenified Public
Accountants of Kenya;

(c) a representative of the Law Society of Kenya;

(d) three other persons who have at least five years' relevant
experience and hold a degree in taxation, finance,
accounting, economics or law from a university recognized
in Kenya; and

(e) a representative of the Commissioner, who shall be the
secretary to the Committce.

(3) The members of the Comminee shall serve for a term not
exceeding three years and shall be eligible for re-appointmenl for one

further term not exceeding threc ycars.

(4) The quorum for a meeting of the Committee shall be the

chairperson and two others memhers.

(5) The Chairperson shall preside at every meeting of the

Committee at which the chairperson is present and in the absence of the
Chairperson, the members present shall appoint one of their number to
preside over the meeting.

(6) The members of the Committee shall be Paid such

remuneration as the Cabinet Secretary may determine froD time to
time.

8. The office of the chairperson or a member of the Committee
shall become vacant if the holdcr-

(a) resigns by notice in writing to the Cabinet Secretaryi

(b) is convicted of any offence;

(c) is declared bankrupt by a court of competent jurisdiction;

(d) fails to meet his or her tax obligations: or

(e) fails to attend three consecutive meetings without notice to
the chairperson or in case of the chairpe$on to the

Commissioner.

Establishment of
$c Tax ASents
Commillce.

)
a

.C

e)



2052 Kcn;a Subsrdnrt ltgtslotton, 2018

9 (l) Thc Commrssroncr shall, upon rccctvlng any allegatron of
mrsconduct agarnst a tax agcnt, rcfcr thc mattcr to lhc Commlttec to
rnvcstrgatc thc allcgatron

(2) Whcrc thc complarnt rs agatnst a mcmbcr of a rccognrzcd
profcssronal assoclatlon, thc Commrttcc may rcfcr thc mancr to thc
assocratron for rnvcstrgatlon and dctcrmlnatlon ln accordancc wrth the
code of conduct of that assoclatlon

(3) Thc Commrttcc may rccommcnd such drscrphnary or
srmrlar actron as lt may constdcr ncccssary bc takcn agalnst thc tax
agcnt rn addrtlon to thc actron taLcn by thc assocratron

(4) Where thc complatnt ls agalnst a pcrson who ts not a
mcmbcr of a rccognrzcd profcssronal assoctatron, thc Commlttcc shall
grvc lhc lax agcnt an opponuntly to bc heard and pcrmtt thc tax agent
lo rnspcct any rElcvant documcnts rclaled to the allcgatton al lcast
scven days bcforc thc datc ofthc hcanng

(5) The Commrncc may, ln thc coursc of thc tnvcstrgatlons,
hcar such wttncsscs and rccervc such documcntary evtdcncc as may, ln
rts oplnron, assrst ln thc lnvcstlgatlon

(6) Thc Commrttcc shall. cxpcd(rously, but nor latcr than scven
days aftcr thc conclusron of thc rnvcstrgatron, subrntt a rcport to thc
Commrssroncr rccommcndlng that the Commtssroncr-

(a) clcars thc tax agcnt of thc allegatrons;
(b) cautrons, warns or rcpnmands thc tax agcnt,
(c) suspcnds thc rcgrstratron of thc tax agcnl,
(d) dcrcgrstcrs thc tax agcnt, or
(c) takcs such othcr actron that thc Commrssroncr may consrdcr

apPropnatc

(7) Thc Commlssroner shall, wrthln founccn days of rccclvtng
thc rcpon of thc Commrttcc, takc such actton as may bc appropnatc

l0 Any pcrson who-
(a) fraudulcntly makcs, or causcs or pcrrnlts to be madc, any

falsc or rncorrect cnfy lnto thc rcgrstcr matntalncd for thc
purposcs of thcsc Rcgulatrons, or any copy rhcrcof,

(b) fraudulcntly procurcs or attcmpts to procurc, rcglstratlon as a
tax agcnti

(c) knowrngly and wtllfully makcs any statcmcnr whrch rs falsc
or whrch rs mrsleadrng, wtth a vtcw to gatnlng any
advantagc, conccsslon or pnvrlcgc undcr thcsc Rcgulatrons,
or

(d) opcratcs as a tax agcnt wlthoul bcrng rcgtstcrcd,

commlts an offcncc and shall bc hablc, on convlcnon, to a finc
not cxcecdrng two hundrcd thousand shtlllngs or to lmpnsonment for a
tcrm not cxccedrng two years, or both

Datcd thc I4th June, 2018

HENRY ROTICH,
Cabmct Sccretary fot thc Natonal Trcasum and Planntng

Invcstr!.uon of
allcgatrcns of

Offcnccs



Kenta Subsidiary Legislation, 201 8 2053

LEGAL NoTICE No, I 39

THE RETIREMENT BENEFITS ACT, I997

( No.3 of 1997 )

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 55 of the
Retirement Benefits Act, 1997 rhe Cabinet Secretary for the National
Treasury and Planning makes the following Regulations-

THE RETIREMENT BENEFITS (OCCUPATIONAL RETIREMENT
BENEFITS SCHEMES) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 20 I8

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Retirement Benefits
(Occupational Retirement Benefits Schemes) (Amendment)
Regulations. 2018.

2. Regulation 3 of the Retirement Benefits (Occupational
Retirement Benefits Schemes),2000 (in these Regulations referred to
as the "principal Regulations") is amended by insening the following
definition in its proper alphabetical sequence-

"medical fund" means a fund into which all contributions,
investmenl eamings, income and all other moneys payable under
the scheme rules or the provisions of this Act and subsidiary
Regulations shall be paid for the purposes of accessing medical
benefits in retirement.

3. Regulation 8 of the principal Regulations is amended by
adding the following new paragraph immediately after paragraph (4)-

(5) No trustee engaged in any profession or business shall be
engaged in professional services done by him or his firm in
connection to the scherne-

4. Regulation 25 ofthe principal Regulations is amended-

(a) by deleting paragraph (a) of the provision to paragraph (l)
and substituting therefor the following new paragraph-

(a) subject to the amount not exceeding ten percent of the
total accrued benefits transferred to a medical fund, not more
than one-quarter of the remaining retirement benefits may be
commuted in a scheme where members do not make
contributions and not more than one-third of the remaining
retirement benefits may be commuted in a scheme where
members make conlributions:

(b) by deleting paragraph (6) and substituting therefor the
following paragraph -

(6) The scheme rules may provide for the payment of retirement
benefit by way of an income draw down, as an alternative or in addition
lo lhe purchase of annuity for members at reliremenl age:

Provided that the scheme members shall take a minimum period
of ten years.

5. Regulation 39 ofthe principal Regulations is amended-

Cilarion

L fi. ll9/2fi])



2054 Kenya Subsidiary Izgislation, 2018

(a) in paragraph (l), by deleting the expression "three months"
and substituting therefor the expression "four months"; and

(b) in pamgraph (3), by insening the words "less the amount of
the medical fund" at the end of subparagraph (a) of the
proviso.

Dated the l4th June,20l8.

HENRY ROTICH,
Cabinet Secretary for the Nolional Treasury and Planning.

LEGAL NonCE No, I4O

THE PUBLIC FINANCE MANACEMENT ACT
(No.18 of2012)

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 24(4) of the
Public Finance Management Act,2ol2 the Cabinet Secretary for the
National Treasury and Planning makes the following Regulations-

THE PUBLIC FINANCE MANAOEMENT (TOURISM
PROMOTION FUND) REGULATIONS, 20I 8

l. These Regulations may be cited as the Public Finance
Management (Tourism Promotion Fund) Rcgulations, 2018.

2.In these Regulations, unless thc context otherwise requires-

"Board" means the Oversighl Board established under regulation
11..

"Cabinet Secretary" has the meaning assigned to it under section
2 of the Actl

"Fund" means thc Tourism Promotion Fund established under
regulation 3 of thes€ Regulations;

"Officer Administering the Fund" means the Principal Secretary
for the time being responsible for matters relating to tourism;

"op€rational and maintenance exp€nses" means moneys included
in the approved annual budget of the Fund dedicated to meeting the
routine administrative expenses of the Secretariat:

"plugging projects" means proJects which suppon thc
development, promotion and branding of tourism in Kenya;

"tourism events" means natural phenomena or human scheduled
activily which attract visitors to a particular area as organizers,
panicipants, spectalors or service providers to suppon the activity or a

combination of several purpose of enga8ement, including wildebeest
migration, observation of eclipse. exhibition. conferences. sponing
events, cultural feslivals and dances;

"tourism implementing agency' means a govemment agency
involved in the devclopment, promotion and branding of tourism in
Kenya;

Cilation

Interpretation



Kenya Substdory lz gts lohon, 20 I 8 2055

"tounsm nlchc product" mcans an attractron, good or servlce of
spccral appeal and of spccrfrc lnterest to a partrcular market scgmcnt,

"tounsm product" means an atrractlon, good or servtce whtch
contnbutes to the total vrsrtor or tounst cxpencnce ln a destrnatron.
rncludrng wrldlrfc. culture, nvers. bcachcs. hlstoncal sttes, muscums.
hotcls and anrfacl\

3 Thcrc rs cstabLshcd a fund to bc known as the Tounsm
Promotron Fund whrch shall opcralc undcr thc budgctrng, accountrng,
rcportrng and audrtrng framcwork of thc Act

4 Thc rn(ral caprtal of thc Fund shall bc 200 mtllton shtlltngs
appropriated by Parhamcnt rn thc irnancral ycar 20l8/19

5 (l) Thc objcct and purposc of thc Fund shall bc to provrdc
funds to support dcvclopmcnt, promotlon and brandrng of tounsm
SCCtor

(2) Wrthout prcJudrcc to the gcncralrty of paragraph (l) of thrs
rcgulatron, thc Fund shall provrdc for-

(a) financrng dcvclopmcnt, promotron and brandrng programmcs
and rnrtlatlvcs !n relatron to tourism products, rncludlng
tounsm nlchc prcducts and tourrsm cvcnts,

(b) financrng dcvcloprnent, promotron and brandrng of Kenya tn
spccrfic local, rcgronal and rntcmatronal markct scgmcnts,

(c) financrng tounsm data capturc, analysrs and drsscmrnatron of
thc samc and any othcr rclatcd rcscarch whlch may tncludc
dcploymcnt of tcchnology bascd apphcatrons,

(d) financrng dcvclopment of tounsm factlttrcs and
cstabllshmcnts rn arcas whcrc thc pnvatc scctor rs unablc or
unwrllrng to dcvclop. but wlth a hrgh potcntral for tounsm
promotron and brandlng,

(e) co-financrng of tounsm promollon prolects wrth thc county
govcmmcnts on thc basls of an agrccd ratro of matchlng
grants.

(fl fundrng programmcs and rnrtratrvcs for tounsm safcty and
sccunty gcarcd towards dcvelopmcnt, promotron and
brandrDg of tounsm scctor.

(g) financrng dcvclopment of rnnovatrons and rnventlons whlch
promotc tounsm dcvclopmcnt, promotlon and brandtng,

(h) fundrng of pluggDg proJccts whrch contnbutc to
dcvclopmcnt, promonon and brandrng of tounsm scctor,

(r) financrng programmcs and rnrtratrvcs gcarcd towards
tounsm lnlclhgcncc and rnformalron gathcnng for purposcs
of dcvcloprng, promotlng and brandrng tounsm rn Kcnya,
and

0) standard dcvclopment and capacrty burldrng rn thc tounsm
scctor

Eslablshmcnl of
th€ Fund

Capnal of fic

Obtcct and

PurPosc



2056 Kc n'-o Subs drury Lz gr slat on, 20 1 8

6 Thc Fund shall consrst of-
(a) procccds rcalscd undcr scctlon 3 of the Alr Passcngcrs

Servrcc Chargc Act;

(b) moncys appropnatcd by thc Nanonal Assembly for thc
purposc of the Fund,

(c) rncomc from rnvcstmcnts ofany surplus funds rn thc Fund,

(d) rntcrcst accrurng to thc Fund,

(c) grants, donalrons or othcr bcqucsts madc to thc Fund,

(f) moncys pard rnto thc Fund from any othcr sourcc as may
from tlmc to trmc bc approvcd by the Cabrnct Sccrctary, and

(g) any othcr rnoneys as may bc provrdcd for rn an Act of
ParLamcnt

7 (l) Thcre shall b€ pald out of thc Fund monrcs rn rcslrcct of
any cxpcnscs rncurrcd rn pursuant of thc ob1ects and purposcs for
whrch the Fund rs estabhshcd

(2) Thc expcndrture rncurrcd out of thc Fund shall bc on thc basrs
of and hmrted to annual work programmes and cost cstrmatcs whlch
shall bc prcpared by thc Offrccr Admrnrstenng thc Fund, and approycd
by thc Board at the bcgrnnrng of thc financral ycar to whrch thcy relatc

(3) Any rcvlslon of thc approvcd annual work programmcs, and
of any cost cstrmatc, shall bc rcfcrrcd to $c Board for approval

8 Thc carnrngs of, or accruals to thc Fund shall bc rctarncd rn thc
Fund, and shall bc spcnt only for thc oblccts and purposcs for whrch thc
Fund rs cstabhshcd

9 A tounsm rmplcmcntrng agcncy shall bc clrgrblc to apply for
fundrng from thc Fund rf-

(a) ln the casc of a statc corporatlon or a govcrnmcnt agcncy-
(r) has an annual work programmc algncd to thc strategrc

plan of thc corporatron or agcncy and thc mcdlum tcrm
plan approvcd by thc govcmrng dy of thc statc
corporatlon or agcncy,

(r) has, rn relatron to an rnfrastructurc dcvclopmcnt proJcct,
prcparcd prolcct dcsrgns, plans and brlls of quantrtrcs,
approvcd by thc govcmrng body and thc requrslrc
rcgulatory approvals from relcvant govemment
rnstrtutrons. and

(rr) mccts any othcr cntcna sct out by thc Board

(b) rn casc of a Mrnrsry or a Shre Dcpanmcnl, thal Mlnlstry or
Statc Dcpanmcnt -
(r) has an annual work programmc ahgncd to the stratcgrc

plan ofthc Mrnrstry or statc depanmcnt and thc medrum
term plan approvcd by the Cabrnct Sccrctary rcsponsrblc
for that Mrnrstry or Statc Dcpartmcnt,

Sourccs of funds

Cap 475

thc Fund

Rcl.nuon of

Fundrng cLgrbrlrty



Kenva Substdnry lt grslauon, 20 I 8 2057

(D) has, ln rclatron to an rnfrastructurc dcvclopmcnt
proJcct, prcpared ProJect dcsrgns, plans and btlls of
quantrtrcs, approvcd by thc Accounhng Officcr of that
Mlnrstry or Statc Dcpanmcnt and thc rcqursrtc
rcgulatory approvals from rclcvant govcmmcnt
rnstrtutrons, and

(rr) mects any othcr cntcna sct out by thc Board

lO (l) Thc Officcr Admrnrstcnng thc Fund shall by thc 30D

August of cach year rssuc a budgct crrcular to thc chglblc pcrsons

rndlcatrng-

(a) thc ccrhngs for fundrng cach oblccts of thc Fund,

(b) pnonty programmcs, proJccts and actrvrtrcs to bc fundcd rn
that financral ycar, and

(c) any olhcr rnformahon that thc Board may consrdcr ncccssary.

(2) A pcrson who wlshcs to rcccrvc fundrng from thc Fund and
mccts the cntena sct out undcr rcgulatron 9 shall at lcast, srx months
bcforc thc commencemcnt of a financral ycar, apply to thc Officcr
Admlnlstcnng thc Fund rn such a manncr as may b€ spcclficd by thc
Board

(3) An applrcatron for fundrng undcr paragraph (2) shall bc
accompanrcd by-

(a) rn casc of a stalc corporallon or govcmmcnt agcncy-

(r) thc mrnutcs of a propcrly constrtutcd mccung of thc
govcrnrng body of thc statc corporatron or govemmcnt
agcncy contarnrng thc rcsolution to apply for fundrng
froD thc Fund,

(r) an annual work programmc altgncd to thc stratcgrc Plan
of thc statc corporrlron or govcmmcnt agcncy approvcd
by thc govcmrng body ofthat corporanon or agcncy and
the Mcdrum Tcrm Plan approvcd by thc Cabrnct
Sccrctary rcsponsrblc for that statc corporatron or
govcrnmcnt aScncy,

(lrr) whcrc thc proJcct rs an rnfrastructurc dcvclopmcnt
prqcct, the proJcct dcsrgns, plans and brlls of quanttttcs,
approvcd by thc Sovcmrng body and thc rcqursitc
rcgulatory approvals from rclcvant govcmmcnt
rnstrtunons, wherc apphcablc,

(rv) a statutory dcclaratron of programmcs fundcd through
othcr sourccs, rf any,

(v) thc dctarls and srgnatoncs of thc bank account rn thc
namc of thc statc corporalron or govemmcnt agcncy
whcrc thc funds shall bc channelcd, and

(vr) any othcr addrtronal rnformatron as may be rcqutrcd by
thc Board

fundrng



2058 Kenya Subs tdory lt g r s lanon, 2O I 8

(c) rn thc casc of a Mrnrslry or Statc Dcpanmcnt -
(r) an annual work programme alrgncd to thc stratcglc plan

of that Mrnrstry or Statc Dcpartmcnt and thc Medrum
Tcrm Plan,

(u) a wnttcn conllrmanon from thc accountrng officcr
rcsponsrblc for thal Mtntstry or Statc Dcpanmcnt that
thc thcrc rs no olhcr fundlng for thc samc programmc,
projcct or actlvtty,

(l[) whcrc rt rs an rnfrastructure dcvelopment projcct, thc
pro1cct dcsrgns, plans and brlls of quantltrcs, approved
by thc Accountrng Officer of that Mrnrstry or Statc
Dcpanmcnt and thc rcqulsrtc rcgulatory approvals from
rclevant govcmmcnt rnstrtutlons, whcrc applcable,

(rv) an accountrng officcrs' dcclaratron of programmcs
fundcd through othcr sourccs, rf any,

(v) thc dctarls and srgnatoncs of thc bank account rn thc
namc of that Mlntstry or Statc Dcpanmcnt wherc thc
funds shall bc channcled; and

(vr) any othcr addrnonal rnformatron as may be requ[cd by
thc Board

(3) A maxrmum of tcn pcr ccntum ( l0%) of thc approvcd budgct
for cach financral year shall bc allocatcd annually by lhc Board, wrth
thc approval of the Cabrnct Sccrctary for thc lrmc bcrng rcsponsrblc for
mattcrs rcla ng to tounsm bascd on thc Mcdrum Tcrm Plan of lhat
Mrnrstry and the Cabrnct Sccrctary for thc Natronal Trcasury, to
rmplcmcnt stratcgrc lntcrvcntlons, programmcs and rnrtlatrvcs through
a tounsm lmplcmcntlng agcncy

I I (l ) Thc funds shall only bc drsburscd rf-

(a) thc drsburscmcnt rs approvcd and recordcd ln mrnutcs of thc
Board; and

(b) thc drsburscmcnt !s to meet thc cxpcnscs rclatcd to thc
oblccts and purposc of thc Fund

(2) The Board may sct out othcr condltlons and rcqurrcmcnts for
rclcasc of funds, to cnsurc efficrcnt and cffcctrvc managcmcnt of
rcsourccs

(3) Moncys may addrtronally bc drsburscd out of thc Fund whcrc
such drsburscmcnts-

(a) rclatc to cxpcndrrurcs that drd not form pan of thc approvcd
budgct for thc financral year rn accordance wrth provlsrons of
thc Act, and

Condrtrons for



Kcnya Subndrury It gtslat on, 20 I 8 2059

(b) havc bccn approvcd by thc Officcr Admmlslcnng thc Fund
and submrrrcd to thc Board for funhcr approval

(4) For purposcs of paragraph (3) of thts rcgulatron, a

supplcmcntary budgct shall bc prcparcd by thc Officer Admtnrstcnng
thc Fund and approvcd rn accordancc wlth thc provlslons of rcgulation
10, provrdcd dlsburscmcnt undcr the supplcmcntary budgct complles
wrth thc rcqurrcmcnts of thcse Regulatlons

l2 (l) A rccrprcnl ofthc funds shalF

(a) submlt quartcrly and annual progress repons of the
programmcs, proJccts and rnrttattvcs fundcd by thc Fund; and

(b) allow staff of thc secrctanat lo monrtot and cvaluatc
programmcs, proJccts and rnrtratrves fundcd by thc Fund

(2) A rcclprcnt of thc funds shall rctum any unutrhzcd funds
dlsbursed in accordancc wrth thcsc Rcgulattons whcrc-

(a) thc purposc for whrch thc funds werc drsburscd was not
undcnakcn,

(b) thc purposc for whrch thc funds wcrc dtsburscd was
undcnakcn bul thc funds wcrc not fully utrhzcd, or

(c) savlngs arc rcahzcd as a rcsult of changc In clrcumstanccs

(3) Ununhzed funds retumcd undcr paragraph (2) shall bc
rccordcd as rcccrpts of thc Fund

(4) A rccrprent of thc funds who farls to comply wnh paragraph
(2) and (3) shall not bc ehgrblc for any subscquent drsburscmcnt untrl
that pcrson has fully comphcd wrth thc provtstons of thcsc Rcgulatrons

13 A tounsm rmplcmcnbng agcncy shall only rcquest for
payments ftom thc Fund whcrc-

(a) thc projcct to bc financcd ts procurcd rn accordancc wtth thc
Pubhc Procurcmcnt and Assct Drsposal Act,20l5,

(b) thc proJccr to bc financcd rs rncludcd tn thc approvcd
cstrmatcs of rcvcDuc and cxpendtturc for thc tounsm
lmplcmcntrng agcncy; and

(c) thc rcqurrcmcnts of rcgulatton 2'l arc met

l4 Thc Officcr Admlnrstcnng thc Fund may wrthhold paymcnts
duc and owrng to a tounsm rmplcmcntrng agency whcrc-

(a) that tounsm rmplcmcntrng agcncy fatls to comply wrth thc
provrsrons of rcgulatron 12,

(b) thc Officcr Admrnrstcnng thc Fund ts of thc optnron that thc
provrsrons of lhcsc Rcgulatrons havc not bccn compltcd wrth,
or

Obhgrtrons of thc

Rcqucst for
prymcnr from thc

No l3 of20l5

Wrthholdtng of
Prymcnts



20$t Kenya Subsdnrt Legtslunon, 2018

(c) a tounsm rmplemcntrng agcncy provrdcs rnformatron

Justrfyrng thc proposcd wrthholdrng wrth approval of thc
agcncy govemrng body, and rhc Boerd approvcs thc
wrthholdrng

15 Thc Board, wrth thc pnor approval of thc Cabrnct Sccrcrary
for thc tirnc bclng responsrblc for mattcrs relatrng to tounsm and thc
Cabrnct Sccrctary to thc Narronal Trcasury, may-

(a) rmposc such pcnaltrcs, rncludlng thc suspcnsron of fundrng
allocatrons, as rt may drrcct thc tounsm rmplcmcntrng
agcnclcs whrch farl to comply wrth any of thc provtsrons
undcr thcse Rcgulatlons, or

(b) takc such rcmedral, supplcmcntary or altcmatrvc mcasurcs to
cnsurc thc pcrformancc of thc functrons of tounsm
rmplcmcntrnS agcncrcs whrch lrcrsrstcnlly farl to drschargc
thcrr functlons undcr thcsc Rcgulatlons

16 ( l) Appllcatrons for prymcnt out of thc Fund shall bc madc
by a tounsm rmplcmcntrng agency !n a format specrficd by thc Board at
lcast twcnty-onc (21) days bcforc thc duc datc

(2) Any apphcahons for paymcnt madc undcr par-agraph (l) of
thrs rcgulatron shall bc supponcd by documents rcqurrcd undcr thcsc
Rcgulatrons whrch shall rncludc-

(a) thc namc and addrcss of thc paycc (tounsm rmplcmcnttng
agency),

(b) lhc bank account dctarls of thc paycc,

(c) spccrfic projcct to bc financcd, and

(d) any othcr addrtronal tnformatton as may bc dccmcd
necessary by thc tounsm rmplcmcntrng agcncy

(3) Any apphca on undcr thcsc Rcgulatrons shall bc srgncd by an
accountlng officcr or thc chrcf cxccutrvc officcr of a tourtsm
rmplcmcntrng agcncy or an officcr dclcg3tcd by hrm or hcr,ln wntrng.

17 (l) Thcrc rs cstabltshcd r board to bc known as Oversrght
Board for the Fund whrch shall consrst of-

(a) thc Cablnct Secrctary responsrblc for mattcrs rclatrng to
tounsm, who shall be thc charrpcrson of thc Board, or rn hrs
or hcr abscncc, thc Pnnclpal Sccrctary rcsponsrblc for
mancrs relatrng to tounsm,

(b) the Pnnclpal Sccrctary rcsponsrblc for mattcrs relatrng to
tounsm,

(c) thc Pnncrpal Sccretary rcsponsrblc for mattcrs rclatrng to
financc,

(d) thc Pnncrpal Sccrctary rcsponsrblc for mattcrs rclatrng to
Transpon,

(c) thc Pnncrpal Sccrctary rcsponsrblc for mattcrs rclatrng to
Culturc,

lmposllron ol

Applrc.rrons for

lhc fund

Establshmcnt md

Board



Kcnya Subsrdrury Iz grslot on, 20 I 8 206t

(f) thc Pnncrpal Sccrctary rcsponsrblc for mancrs rclatrng to
wrldhfc,

(g) thc Pnncrpal Sccrctary rcsponsrble for matten rclatrng to
Intcmal Sccunty,

(h) two pcrsons of opposrtc gendcr apporntcd by thc Cabrnet
sccrctary rcsponsrblc for mattcrs rclatrng to lounsm ln
accordancc wrth Artrclc 27 of thc Constrtutron

(2) A pcrson shall not bc apporntcd undcr paragraph (l) (h) of
thrs reSulatlon, unless that-

(a) holds a unrversrty dcgrcc rccognrzcd rn Kcnya,

(b) has not lcss than fiftccn ycars' cxp€ncnce rn thc rclcvant
ficld, and

(c) mccts thc rcqulrcmcnts of Chaptcr Srx of thc Constrtutron

(3) A pcrson appornted under paragraph (l Xh) of thrs rcgulatron
shall scrvc for a pcnod of thrcc (3) ycars, and thc pcnod may bc
rcncwcd for a funhcr final tcrm of thrcc (3) years

l8 Thc functrons of thc Board shall bc to-
(a) advlsc rhc Cabrnct Sccrctary on thc fundrng rcqurrcmcnts of

thc Fund,

(b) rcvrcw and adopt thc estrmatcs of annual rcvcnuc and
cxpcndrturc of thc Fund and rccommcnd lhcm to thc Cablnct
Sccrctary for thc ttmc bclng rcsponsrblc for mattcrs rclatrng
to touflsm for concurrcncc and onward transmrssron to thc
Cabrnet Sccrctary for approval,

(c) dctcrmrnc thc allocatron of financlal rcsourccs from thc Fund
rcqulrcd by thc tounsm rmplcmcnllng agcncrcs for lhe
dcvclopmcnt, promotron and brandrng of tounsm scctor ln
Kcnya,

(d) cnsurc that thc annual estrmatcs of rcvcnuc and expcndrturc
for thc Fund rncludc rctcntron funds for thc prcccdrng
financral ycar whrch shall bc rcvotcd,

(c) cnsurc that only pro.;ccts rncludcd rn thc tounsm
rmplcmcntrng agcncy annual programmc arc promotcd for
fundrng undcr thcse Rcgulatrons,

(f) advrsc thc Cabrnct Sccrctary on amounts and tlmlng for thc
fund transfcrs rnto thc Fund,

(g) approvc and rcvrcw thc lnvcstmcnt of surplus funds from ftc
Fund;

(h) advrsc thc Cabrnet Sccrctary on any addrtronal sourccs of
funds for rhe Fund.

(r) approvc thc financral statcmcnts prcparcd by thc Officcr
Admlnrstcnng thc Fund bcforc submrsslon to thc Audltor-
Gcneral, and

Functrcns of thc
Board



2062 Kenya S ubstdrury lt gtslanon, 20 1 8

0) approvc thc non-financral rcpons of thc Fund bcfore
submrttlng thcm to thc Cablnct Sccrctery rcsponsrblc for
tounsm for onward ransmrsslon lo thc Natronal Trcasury

l9 (l) Thc Board shall, through a compctrtrvc rccrultmcnt
proccss, ldcntlfy and shonLst thrcc successful pcrsons rn ordcr of mcnt
and forward thc namcs to rhc Cablnct Sccrctary for thc nmc bcrng
rcsponsrble for mancrs rclatrng to tounsm to appornl one of thcm to bc
thc Chrcf Exccutrvc Officcr of the Fund

(2) A pcrson shall not bc quahfied for apporntmcnt as thc chrcf
cxccutrvc officcr undcr paragraph ( l) unlcss that pcrson -

(a) holds at lcast a dcgrec from a unrversrty rccognrzed rn Kenya
ln thc field of tounsm, wrldhfc. cconomrcs, financc, natural
rcsourccs or any othcr rclcvant ficld,

(b) has at lcast ten ycars practrcal cxpcncncc ln scntol
managcmcnt capacrty, and

(c) satrsfics thc rcqulremcnts of Chaptcr Srx of thc Constrtutron.

(3) Thc chrcf cxccutrvc officcr of thc Fund shall hold officc for a

tcrm of thrcc ycars, but shall bc chgrblc for rc-apporntmcnt for one
funhcr tcrm of thrce ycars

(4) Thc chrcf cxccutrvc officcr shall bc the Sccrctary to thc Board
and shall bc rcsponsrblc for thc day to day runnrng of thc Fund
rncludrng thc staff of thc sccrctanat of thc Fund

20 (l) Thc Pnncrpal Sccrctary rcsponsrblc for mattcn rclatrng to
tounsm shall bc thc Officcr Admrnrstcnng lhc Fund

(2) Thc functrons of thc Officcr Admrnrstcnng thc Fund shall bc
to-

(a) supcrvrsc and control thc admrnrstration ofthc Fund brsed on
a fivc ycar tounsm rnvcstmcnt prograDmc approvcd by the
Cabrnct Sccrctary for tounsm and thc Cabrncr Sccrctary for
thc Nahonal Trcasury;

(b) rccommcnd thc allocatron of financral rcsourccs from thc
Fund rcqurrcd by the tounsm rmplcmcntrng agcncrcs for lhc
dcvclopment, promotron and brandrng of tounsm scctor rn
Kcnya,

(c) prcparc cstrmates of annual rcvcnuc and expcndrturc of thc
Fund rclatrng to rts purposc and obJcct and operahonal and
marntcnancc cxpcnscs and submrt rt to thc Board for
approval,

(d) estabhsh propcr systcms of rntemal control and manegcmcnt
ln accordancc wrth thc provrsrons of thc Act and thcse
Rcgulallons,

(c) advlsc and consult thc Board on mattcrs rclatrng to thc
admrnrstratron of thc Fund,

(0 co-ordrnatc monltonng and cvaluatron of tounsm
devclopmcnt, promohon and brandrng prqccts financed from
thc Fund,

Apporntm€nl of

Officcr
Admrnrst.nn! fic
Fund



Kcnyo Subsrdnry ltgts latron, 20 I 8 2063

(g) advlse and consult wrth the Cabrnet Sccrctary on matters
relatrng to thc admrnlstrallon of thc Fund as may, from tlmc
to trmc, bc ncccssrry,

(h) kccp propcr books of accounts and othcr books and rccords
rclaing to thc Fund and thc actrvltrcs financcd undcr the
Fund and submlt thcm to thc Board,

(r) kecp custody of thc Funds' asscts, cqurpmcnt and propcnrcs
under thc Fund,

0) prcparc financral and non-financral pcrformancc rcpon of
thc Fund and submlt rt to thc Board for approval, and upon
approval transmrt a copy to thc Natlonal Trcasury and
Mlnlsry for mattcrs rclatrng to tounsm;

(k) prcparc thc annual financral statcmcnls and submrt thcm to
thc Board for approval bcforc submissron to the Audltor-
Gcncral wrth a copy to thc Natronal Trcasury and Mtnrstry
for mallcrs rclatrng to tounsm,

(l) fumrsh any addrtronal rnfornatron whrch ls propcr and
sufficlcnt for thc propcr dtscharge of thc mandatc of thc
Audnor-Gcncral; and

(m) undcnakc any othcr duty as thc Board may assrgn through
rcsolutrons

(3) Whcn drscharglng thc functrons under paragraph (2) of thts
rcgulauon, thc Officcr Admrnrstcnng the Fund shall-

(a) comply wrth thc ordrnary budger cyclc tn thc prcparatton of
csllmatcs for thc Fund, and

(b) submrt cstrmatcs of rcvcnuc and cxpendtturc to thc Cablnet
Sccretary by lhc 31" January of thc prcccdtng financtal ycar
for approval

2l Thc Officcr Admrnrstcnng thc Fund shall havc powcr to-

(a) acccss any prolcct rclatcd data hc or shc may nccd from
tounsm rmplcmcntrnS aScncy rn furthcrancc of hrs or hcr
functlons,

(b) call for any addltlonal rnformatton wlth rcspcct to rcqucsts
for payments out of thc Fund; and

(c) causc for a monrtonng and cvaluatton cxerclsc to bc donc to
a tounsm rmplcmcntrng agcncy proJccts fundcd from thc
Fund, and wrth thc approval of the Board

22 (l) Thc Board shall dcsrgnatc a sccrctaflat to support fic
opcrauons of thc Fund whlch shall bc headcd by thc Chlcf Exccutrvc
Officer

(2) Thc Sccrelaflat shall consrst of such staff as thc Board wrth
thc approval of the Cabrnct Sccrctary rcsponstblc for mattcrs rclatlng lo

Powcrs of Officcr
Admrnrsrcflnt thc

Sccrct nal
suppon for
Officcr
Admrnrsrcnng thc



2064 Kenyo Subsrdrury Le grs lanon, 20 1 8

tounsm may, rn consultatron wrth thc Pubhc Scrvrcc Commrsston,
consrdcr ncccssary for thc propcr pcrformancc of thc funcnons of thc
Fund undcr thcsc Rcguletrons

23, (l) Thc Officcr Admrnrstcnng the Fund shall causc an
account lD thc namc of thc Fund to bc malntarncd for thc Fund ln a
bank wrthrn thc Rcpublrc of Kcnya rn lrne wrth scctron 28 of thc Act
and any Rcgulatrons madc thercundcr

(2) AII monrcs payablc rnto thc Fund shall bc rcccrved lnto thc
bank account of the Fund

(3) Thc Fund's accounts shall bc opcratcd by thc Officer
Admrnrstcrrng thc Fund and two other pcrsons nomrnatcd by the
Cabrnct Sccrctary from thc Fund's sccretanat

(4) Thc Officcr Admrnrstcnng thc Fund may opcn and marnta,n
olhcr accounts for thc followrng purposcs-

(a) paymcnts for dcvelopmcnt, promonon and brandrng of
tounsm scctor:

(b) paymcnts of opcratronal and marntcnancc expcnscs; and

(c) rcccrvrng rcccrpts of thc Fund and unuttltzcd funds by
tounsm !mplcmcntrng agcncrcs.

24. Thc Officer Admrnrstenng thc Fund shall cnsurc the accounts
of the Fund arc not ovcrdrawn

25 (l) Thc Board shall ensurc that rn any financral ycar
cxp€ndrturc and commrtmcnts from thc Fund shall not excccd thc
annual rncomc of thc Fund togethcr wlth any surplus rncome broughl
forward from a prcvrous ycar

(2) If, rn exceptlonal crrcumstanccs, thc rncomc from fic Fund or
othcr funds togcthcr wrth any surplus rncomc brought forward from a
prcvrous ycar ls rnsufficrcnt to mcet thc actual or cstrmatcd habllrtrcs of
thc Board and thc Fund, thc Cabrnct Sccrctary to thc Natronal Trcasury
may, wrth thc approval of Parllemcnt, mekc advances to thc Board and
such advanccs shall bc madc on such tcrms and condlttons, whcthcr as
to rcpaymcnt or olhcrwlsc, as thc Cabrnct Sccrctary to thc Natronal
Trcasury may dctermrnc

Provldcd that any such advance shall bc rcpatd from thc rncomc
of thc Fund

26 Thc Board may wrth thc conscnt of the Cabrnct Secrctary to
thc Natlonal Trcasury and thc Cabtnet Secrctary rcsponslblc for mattcrs
rclatrng to tounsm, rnvcst any of rts surplus funds rn Govcmmcnl
sccuntrcs

27 Thc Fund shall bc govemcd by all rclcvant financral and
procurcmcnt laws and regulatrons as apphcablc,

28 ( I ) Thc Cabrnct Sccrctary shall at rhe clapsc of tcn ycars from
thc datc of commcnccmcnt of thcsc Regulatlons causc a rcvtcw to bc

Ovcrdrawn

Borrd

Invcshcnls of th€

funds

Frn.nctrl and

R.guhrrons

pcrformancc of
thc Furd



Ke nyo Subsrdrury k grslotion, 20 I 8 2065

o

conducted on thc pcrformancc of the Fund tn accordancc wlth thc
rcqulrcmcnts of thc Act and Rcgulattons thcrcunder

(2) Thc rcvrcw shall dctermtnc whcthcr thc Fund has mct thc

obJcctrvcs for whrch lt was cstabltshcd

(3) Thc rcpon on thc revlcw shall bc submrttcd to lhc Cabrnct
and Parlrament for approval

29 (l) At lcast srx months bcforc thc commcnccmcnt of cach

financral ycar, thc Board shall causc to bc prcparcd csttmatcs of thc
rcvcnuc and cxpcndlturc ofthc Board for that year

(2) The annual cstrmatcs shall makc Provrslon for all estlmalcd
rcvcnucs rnto and cxpcndltures from thc Fund for thc financtal ycar

and ln paircular, thc cstrmatcs shall provlde for-
(a) rcvenucs proJcctcd lo bc rccctved by thc Fund from thc

sourccs of funds provrdcd for undcr thcsc Rcgulatlons;

(b) moncys allocatcd to tounsm lmplcmenllng agcnctcs undcr
thcsc Rcgulatrons;

(c) monlcs for thc admlnlstratlon cxpcnscs of lhe Fund,

(d) thc paymcnt of thc salancs, allowanccs and othcr chargcs In

rcspect of the staff of thc Board, wherc applrcable:

(c) thc paymcnt of pcnstons, gratutttes and othcr chargcs ln
rcspcct of thc staff Fund, whcrc appltcablc, and

(f) thc propcr marntcnancc of thc asscts, cqulpmcnt and

ProPcnlcs undcr thc Fund

(3) Thc annual cstrmatcs shall bc approvcd by the Board before
thc commcnccmcnl of lhc financral ycar to whtch thcy rclatc and shall
be submrttcd to thc Cabrnct Sccretary for aPproval and thercafter, thc
Board shall not rncrcase or dccrcasc thc annual csttmatcs unless a
supplcmcntary budgct has bccn approvcd tn thc samc manncr.

30 (l) Thc Officer Admlnrstcnng lhe Fund shall prcpare

quancrly financral and non-financtal rcpons rn accordancc wtth thc

format prcscnbcd by thc Pubhc Scctor Accountlng Standards Board
and thc Act and submrt rl lo thc Board for approval

(2) Upon approval, undcr paragraph ( l), thc Officcr
Admrnrstcnng thc Fund shall submrt fic rcpon to thc Natlonal Trcasury
and Mrnlstry rcsponsrblc for mattcrs rclatlng to tounsm

3l (l) Thc Board shall causc to bc kcpt all propcr books and

rccords of account of thc rncomc, cxpcndlturc, asscts, cqutpmcnt and

propcnlcs of thc Fund

(2) Wrthrn a pcnod of thrcc months from thc cnd of cach

financral ycar, lhc Board shall submrt to thc Audrtor-Gcncral wtth a

copy to thc Natronal Trcasury, thc accounts of lhc Fund togethcr
wtth-

(a) a statemcnt of the tncomc and expcnditurc of thc Fund dunng
thc financtal ycar, and

Qurn.rly rEponr



2066 Kenya Subsidiary l*gislotion, 2018

(b) a statement of the assets and liabilities of the Fund on the last
day of that financial year.

(3) The financial statements prepared under paragraph (2) shall
be in accordance with the prescribed format by the Public Sectol
Accounling Standards Board and the Act.

(4) The accounts of the Fund shall be audited and reponed upon
in accordance with the Public Audit Act.20l5.

(5) The Board shall inform and keep the public informed of its
activities and operations through regular publications and such
activities and operations shall be accessible to the public unless there
are reasons of commercial confidentiality or security justifying
exclusions.

32. ( | ) The administrative expenses of the Fund shall not exceed
three p€r centum of the approved budget of each financial year.

(2) Despite the provisions of paragraph ( I ), the Board may, with
the concurrence of the Cabinet Secretary for the time being responsible
for matters relating to tourism, recommend increase of the
administrative expenses from three pcr centum to five per centum
where there are justifiable reasons to the Cabinet Secretary for approval
for lhat panicular financial year.

33. A person who misappropriates any funds or assets from the
Fund, or assists or causes any person to misappropriate or apply the
funds otherwise than in the manner provided in these Regulations.
commits an offence and shall, upon conviction. be liable to
imprisonment for a term not exceeding five years or to a fine not
exceeding ten million shillings or to both.

34. (l) The Cabinet Secrelary may wind-up rhe Fund with the
approval of the National Assembly where the Cabiner Secretary
considers that the Fund has successfully compleled the specific
objectives for which it was created.

(2) On winding up of the Fund -
(a) the officer Administering the Fund shall call on the tourism

implementing agencies to submit any valid outstanding
obligations and commitmenrs for payment;

(b) the Officer Administering the Fund shall pay any amount
remaining in the Fund inro rhe National Exchequer Account
for the credit of the national govemment;

(c) the Cabinet Secretary shall pay any deficit in the Fund from
the funds of the nalional govemmenr in the National
Exchequer Account with the approval of rhe National
Assembly; and

(d) assets, equipment and propenies other than cash of the Fund
shall be transferred to the Ministry for thc time being
responsible for malters relating to lourism.

(3) Within three months upon the decision to wind up the Fund,
the Officer Adminislering the Fund shall prepare final financial and

No.14 of20l5

Offcnces and
pcnallics.

winding- up of
thc Fund.



K enya Subsrdury lt grslatron, 20 1 8 206',1

non-financral statcmcnts of thc Fund and submtt thcm to thc Board for
approval

(4) Upon approval undcr paragraph (3), thc admmrstrator shall
submr thc final financtal and non-financtal statcmcnts to thc Cabrnct
Sccrctary

(5) Thc Cabrnct Secrctary shall submtl a final statcmcnt of
accounts to Parhamcnt and to thc Audltor-Gcncral for audtt wtthrn
thrcc months ftom thc datc of thc dcctsron to wrnd uP thc Fund

Datcd thc l4rh Junc. 2018

HENRY ROTICH.
Cabmct SecrelaD^ for ,he Nottonal Trcasury and Planrung

LEGALNoncE No I4I

THE PUBLIC FINANCE MANACEMENT ACT

(No 18 of2Ol2)

lN EXERCISE of thc powcrs conferrcd by sccnon 205 of thc
Publrc Frnancc Manegcmcnt Act,2012, thc Cabrnct Sccrctary for thc
Natronal Trcasury and Plannrng makcs thc followtng Rcgulatrons-

THE PUBLIC FINANCE MANAGEMENT (NATIONAL
GOVERNMENT) (AMENDMENT) RECULATIONS, 20 IE

I Thcsc Rcgulatrons may bc cltcd as thc Publlc Flnancc
Managcmcnl (Natronal Govcmment) (Amcndmcnt) Rcgulatrons, 201 8

2. Thc Pubhc Frnancc Managcmcnt (Nanonal Govemmcnt)
Rcgulatrons,20l5 arc amcndcd tn rcgulatron 219 by dclctrng paragraph
(2) and lnscrtrng the followrng ncw paragraphs tmmcdtatcly aftcr
paragraph (l)-

(2) A rcgulatory authonty cstabhshcd by an Act of
Parhamcnt and rcfcrred to undcr rcgulatton 2ll (4) shall rcmrt lo
thc Collcctor nrncty pcr ccntum of rts surPlus funds nol lalet than
thfiy days aftcr it ls rcponcd rn thc audltcd financial statcmcnts
aftcr thc cnd of each financtal ycar

(2A) For thc purpose of thrs rcgulalton, "Collcclor" mcans

thc Commrssroncr Gcncral apporntcd undcr scctlon ll of thc
Kenya Rcvcnuc Authoflty Act, 1995

Dated thc l4th Junc,2018

HENRY ROTICH,
Cabnct Secretary for lhe Nauonal Tr.asury and Plonnng

L N 3420t5

No 2 of 1995



2068 Kenya Subsidiary Legislution, 201 8

LECAL NorrcE No. 142

THE PROCEEDS OF CRIME AND ANTI-MONEY
LAUNDERING ACT, 2OO9

(No.9 d 2009)

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 134 of the
Proceeds of Crime and Anti-MoDey Laundering Act, 2009, rhe Cabinet
Secretary for the National Treasury and Planning makes the following
Regulations-

THE PROCEEDS OF CRIME AND ANTI-MONEY LAUNDERING
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 20 I8

l. These Regulations may be cited as rhe Proceeds of Crime
and Anti-Money Laundering (Amendment) Regulations, 201 8.

2. The Proceeds of Crimc and Anti-Money Laundering
Regulations. 2013 (in these Regulations referred to as the "principal
Regulations") are amended by insening the following new regularion
immediately after regulation 2 -
Application 24. These Regulations shall apply to all

preventive measures that apply to anti-money
laundering activities including measures for
combating terrorism fi nancing.

3. The principal Regulations are amended by inserting the
following new regulation immediately after regulation 7 -

Policiesand 7A. (l) A reponing institurion shall haveprocedurcs' policies and procedures io address any money
laundering or terrorism financing risks associated
with non-face-to-face business relationships or
transactions.

(2) The policies and procedures referred to in
paragraph (l) shall apply when establishing customer
relationships and whcn conducting on-going due
diligence.

Datcd the l4th June,2018.

HENRY ROTICH.
Cabinet Secretary for the Notional Treasur.,- <tnd Planning.

LEGAL NoTICE No, I43

THE AIR PASSENGER SERVICE CHARGE ACT

(CaP 475)

IN EXERCISE of the powers confened by section 3(3) of rhe Air
Passenger Service Charge Act, the Cabinet Secretary for the National
Treasury and Planning makes the following Order-

Cilalion.

L.N.59/2013



Kenya Subs id iar y- Le gis lation, 20 I 8 2069

t

THE AIR PASSENGER SERVICE CHARGE ACT
(APPORTIONMENT) ORDER 20I 8

l. This Oder may be referred to as the Air Passenger Service
Charge t Apponionment) Order 2018.

2. The proceeds of the charge collected under section 3(l) of
the Act shall be apponioned among the Kenya Airpons Authority, the
Kenya Civil Aviation Authority and the Tourism Promotion Fund as

follows -
(a) in the case of the charge collected under paragraph (a) -

(i) sixty percent thereofto the Kenya Airpons Authority,

(ii) twenty percent to the Kenya Civil Aviation Authority
and

(iii) twenty percent ro the Tourism Promotion Fundi and

(b) in the case of the charge collected undcr paragraph (b) -
(i) fifty percent thereof to the Kenya Airpons Authority:

(ii) thirty percent to the Kenya Civil Aviation Authority,
and

(iii) twenty percent to the Tourism Promotion Fund.

Dated the l4th June,20l8.
HENRY ROTICH,

Cabinet Secretan- for the National Treasury and Planning.

I-EGAI- NorrcE No. 144

THE RETIREMENT BENEFITS ACT

(No. 3 of 1997 )

IN EXERCISE of the powers confened by section 55 of th€
Retirement Benefits Act, 1997 the Cabinet Secretary for the National
Treasury and Planning makes the following Regulations-

TIIE RETIREMENT BENEFITS (INDIVIDUAL RETIREMENT
BENEFITS SCIIEMES) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 20 I8

l. These Regulations may be cited as the Retirement Benefits
(lndividual Retirement Benefits Schemes) (Amendment) Regulations,
20t8.

2. Regulation 9 of the Relirement Benefits (Occupational
Retirement Benefits Schemes) Regulations, 2000 (in these Regulations
referred to as the "principal Regulations") is amended by adding the
following new paragmph immediately afier paragraph (4)

(6) No trustee engaged in any profession or business
shall be engaged in professional services done by him or his
firm in connection to the scheme-

Citarion

L.N. I t8i 2000.



2070 Kenya Subsidiary b gis lat ion, 20 I 8

3. Regulation 15 of the principal Regulatiors is amended by
inserting rhe following paragraphs immcdiately after paragraph ( lF

(lA) A scheme shall allow for additional voluntary
contributions by a member in respect of funding of a medical
fund to be accessed at retirement:

Provided that the funds shall be segregated and invested as per
the investment policy ofthe fund for this purpose.

(lB) The scheme rules shall provide that a member may
transfer a ponion of the member's benefits to a medical cover
provider where the member has been unable to build a suflicient
post-retirement medical fund from additional contributions.

4. Regulation 32 ofth€ principal Regulations is amended-

(a) in paragraph (l), by deleting the expression "six months"
and substituting therefor the expression "four months"; and

(b) in paragraph (3), by insening the words "less the amount of
the medical fund" at the end of subparagraph (a) of the
proviso.

Dated the l4th June,20l8.

HENRY ROTICH,
Cabinet Secretaryfor the National Treasury and Planning.

,

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE COVERNMENT PRINTER. NAIROBI



l


